CLAY COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
8:30 A.M., TUESDAY, MAY 5, 2020
County Board Room, 3rd Floor, Courthouse
MINUTES

The Clay County Board of Commissioners met in regular session with the following Commissioners present:
Frank Gross, Jim Haney, Kevin Campbell, Jenny Mongeau, and Grant Weyland. Others present or joining
remotely: County Attorney Brian Melton, County Administrator Stephen Larson, and Senior Administrative
Assistant Colleen Eck. ~

CALL TO ORDER
Chair Gross called the meeting to order.

APPROVAL OF AGENDA
On motion by Commissioner Mongeau, seconded by Commissioner Campbell, and unammously carried, the
Board approved the agenda with one addition: Budget impacts regarding Covid-19.

2019 PERFORMANCE CREDIT REPORT - COUNTY FEEDLOT OFFICER
By consent, the Board approved the County Feedlot Officer’s Annual Report for 2019.

REQUESTS FOR TAX ABATEMENTS DUE TO CLERICAL ERRORS
By consent, the Board approved tax abatements for two properties in the City of Glyndon for exemptions
due to the use/ownership of the properties.

CITIZENS TO BE HEARD
During this pandemic, citizens continue to have the opportunity to share feedback at board meetings via
website link. Mr. Larson noted there have been no requests submitted for this meeting.

APPROVAL OF PAYMENT OF BILLS AND VOUCHERS

On motion by Commissioner Campbell, seconded by Commissioner Haney, and unanimously carried, the
Board approved payment for bills and vouchers totaling $759,418 from 83 vendors. From that total, 60
warrants issued were under $2,000 ($32,532) and the following 23 were over $2,000:

Construction Engineers, Inc. $349,964 Stein's, Inc $5,160
West Central Regional Juvenile Center $78,720 Magic Fund . $3,980
Clay Co Social Services $74,500 Klein McCarthy & Co Ltd $3,821
Otter Tail Co Public Health $36,401 Moorhead Public Service $3,420
Clay Co Social Services $33,536 Homemakers Villa $3,410
Marco Technologies LLC $29,249 Brock White Co LLC $3,318
Prairie Lakes Municipal Solid Waste Auth  $25,840 Hagen/Chad $2,775
Clay Co Public Health $23,682 H & H Transport LLC - $2,691
Historical & Cultural Society of Clay Co $15,881 Wells Fargo Real Estate Tax Service $2,561
Becker Co Public Health $13,498 South East Education Co-op $2,501
Wilkin Co Public Health $7,412 Pelican Rapids Comm Food Shelf ~ $2,442

Sanford Health $2,123



APPROVAL OF MINUTES FROM APRIL 21, 2020
On motion by Commissioner Haney, seconded by Commissioner Grant, and unanimously carried, the Board

approved the minutes from April 21, 2020.

ANNUAL REPORT FOR ADULT MENTAL HEALTH LOCAL ADVISORY COUNCIL

Alison Wolbeck, Co-Chair for Clay County Adult Mental Health Local Advisory Council, was present with an
annual report from the advisory council. The report primarily focuses on addressing the needs of adults with
mental illness in the County. She thanked the Board for their continued financial support. In the past year
they expended funds on a prize wheel and prizes for a greater understanding of mental health. They were
also able to provide stipends for participation in community mental health projects. The Covid-19 pandemic
has added stressors on individuals and housing expenses have continued to increase. They recommend
continued support to maintain low rental housing and consistent funding for Social Services to help maintain
stable housing. The current membership list for the Local Advisory Council for Adult Mental Health needs
to be approved by the Board. The membership has not changed since last year.

On motion by Commissioner Weyland, seconded by Commissioner Campbell, and unanimously
approved, the Board approved the Local Advisory Council for Adult Mental Health membership list.

ANNUAL REPORT FOR CHILDREN’S MENTAL HEALTH LOCAL ADVISORY COUNCIL AND PROCLAMATION
FOR MENTAL HEALTH MONTH

Carolyn Strnad, Co-Chair of Children’s Mental Health Local Advisory Council (LAC), addressed the Board. She
reviewed their projects from the last year including a game they developed with emoji faces that has been
well-received. Some of the events they participate in have been cancelled due to the Corona virus. Feedback
on the parent surveys shows an increase in awareness of the services available to them regarding mental
health. Results from a professional survey include transportation barriers and parent’s lack of knowledge
on accessing services. Ms. Strnad noted they have made some progress in getting gas cards, free bus passes,
and volunteer drivers, but more volunteer drivers are still needed. They also get some donations for Uber
rides. When a case manager brings a child to an appointment, they are not allowed to transport the parent.
Medical Assistance and the PMAP Plan set that rule.

Ms. Strnad stated the program’s successes are due in part to Social Services Director Rhonda Porter for
working with a pilot project and being involved in the LAC. Funds have enabled school-based mental health
services to continue in all the County’s public schools. Commissioner Haney is part of the LAC group that
meets every month. She thanked Commissioner Haney, the other Commissioners, and Ms. Porter and Ms.
Thordal from Social Services for being a part of the LAC. She encouraged everyone to wear green on
Thursday in support of children’s mental health.

The Mental Health Month Proclamation was read by Ms. Strnad.
On motion by Commissioner Campbell, seconded by Commissioner Weyland, and unanimously carried the

Board proclaimed May as Mental Health Month and specifically May 7*" as Children’s Mental Health Day in
Clay County.



COVID-19 UPDATE

Public Health Director Kathy McKay provided handouts with the current numbers of positive COVID-19
cases in Minnesota and Clay County. MN has had 7,234 cases and 428 deaths and Clay County 190 cases
and 13 deaths. More asymptomatic cases are showing up. Local testing is being done by Sanford and
Essentia. Clay County residents can also be tested at those facilities. Positive cases are tracked in the
County and State in which the individual resides. The first round of testing was done at the Fargo Dome
and was open for residents on both sides of the river. An individual could go to the Fargo Dome and see if
they fit the criteria to be tested. A second round of testing was started there again on Monday but ended
early when the lab got backlogged.

The Commissioners noted frustration and concern that Clay County residents have not been informed that
they can go to testing sites in Fargo. Commissioner Mongeau commented that Clay County is a hotspot
and it is vital to have individuals tested who are going into congregate living facilities and long-term care
facilities. Ms. McKay stated that staff in those facilities and others with highest risk criteria are receiving
90-minute tests and getting notified the same day. For contact tracing, an individual has to have
experience in public health or epidemiology. Ms. McKay has a list of who could participate in local contact
tracing; however, the State has been able to keep up with contact tracing thus far. She continues to
convey the gaps in communication and frustrations regarding testing for Clay County residents to the MN
Department of Health. Clay County Public Health received another $25,000 in grant dollars to be used for
isolating homeless and the most vulnerable population. The Public Health Department awaits a vaccine to
be developed. If 70% of the population gets vaccinated the outlook would be favorable. The health care
facilities are also hoping to have antibody blood tests for COVID in the near futures. The tests would show
how an individual’s immune system has responded to the virus.

The next local media conference is at 11:00 a.m. tomorrow and the Mayor of Moorhead is conducting a
virtual town hall meeting at 8:00 p.m. today.

APPROVAL OF YEARLY SUPPLY BIDS

County Engineer David Overbo and Assistant Engineer Justin Sorum were present for the requests from
the Highway Department. They handed out the 2020 bid tabs for corrugated metal culverts, bituminous
mixture, rental of construction equipment and furnishing crushed gravel. They recommended approval of
all bids for corrugated metal culverts, bituminous mixture, and rental of construction equipment as -
presented. For gravel bids, they recommended the low bids from Turner Sand and Gravel for Townships 1-
12 and 16-30; and Aggregate Industries for Townships 13-15. The gravel bids were submitted in tonnage
rather than cubic yards this year. A 42-cent royalty is used for material from the County pit to keep it
comparable. Mr. Overbo will track the volumes coming out of the County pit.

Commissioner Mongeau noted appreciation of the plan to get more gravel on the roads this year.
On motion by Commissioner Campbell, seconded by Commissioner Weyland, and unanimously carried,

the Board approved the 2020 bids for corrugated metal culverts, bituminous mixture, and rental of
construction equipment as submitted. See Attachment A. :

w



On motion by Commissioner Campbell, seconded by Commissioner Haney, and unanimously carried, the
Board approved the low gravel bids from Turner Sand and Gravel for Townships 1-12 and 16-30; and
Aggregate Industries for Townships 13-15. See Attachment B.

BID OPENING FOR SIX BRIDGE REPLACEMENTS

Mr. Overbo and Mr. Sorum brought forth seven bids for a combined project that ties replacement of six
bridges together. This is a federally funded project with some dollars also coming out of the bridge bond
funds and some County funds. The bridges are on County Roads 68, 93, CSAH 21 and three on CR 100.
There is one addendum for Co Rd. 21 and a 5% bid bond requirement. The Engineer’s estimate for the
project is $948,941.77. The following bids were opened and entered into the record:

Contractors Total Base Bid Bid Bond 5%  Addendum
Central Specialties $1,271,179.00 X X

Gladen Construction, Inc. $875,624.75 X X

Houle Excavating LLC $1,017,802.00 X X

Korby Contracting Co, Inc. $1,337,800.00 X X
Landwehr Construction, Inc.  $974,625.30 X X

Midwest Contracting LLC $1,082,650.00 X X

Riley Bros. Construction, Inc. ~ $884,816.00 X X

On motion by Commissioner Campbell, seconded by Commissioner Mongeau, and unanimously carried,
the Board approved the low bid from Gladen Construction, Inc. for $875,624.75, contingent on no errors
in the bid and approval of Civil Rights Contract Clearance from the MnDOT office.

ADDITION: BUDGET IMPACTS REGARDING COVID-19

County Administrator Stephen Larson stated there have been some challenges and expected loss in sales
tax with the COVID shutdowns. The County will have a better idea in June of the sales tax revenues. The
Recorder’s Office and Motor Vehicle Department have both lost revenues while being closed for several
weeks. Social Services and Public Health have been able to retain their reimbursements. There has also
been some savings in staff not traveling to attend conferences and workshops. He will ask for the
managers’ input regarding budget impacts in their departments at the next management meetings from
the departments. Commissioner Campbell asked to see the potential lost revenue and ideas on how the
County would make up for it.

COMMITTEE REPORTS/COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR UPDATE/DISCUSSIONS

Many of the following committee reports are from meetings that took place remotely.

= Commissioner Campbell attended a Correctional Facility and Juvenile Center construction wrap-up
meeting.

= Commissioner Mongeau attended a Cass CIay'Food Commission meeting; and partook in phone
conversations with University of Minnesota Extension Dean Durgan; BRRWD Member Jerry
VanAmburg; and Lakeland Mental Health Services for the Correctional Facility. She noted that since
last October 469 inmates have received services offered by Lakeland Mental Health staff in the Clay
County Correctional Facility.

= Commissioner Weyland attended meetings for Correctional Facility and Juvenile Center construction
wrap-up; and Personnel Issues Committee.



= Commissioner Haney participated in the COVID-19 FM Media Conference.

= Commissioner Gross attended a Personnel Issues Committee meeting.

= Stephen Larson attended meetings for Correctional Facility and Juvenile Center construction wrap-
up; Personnel Issues Committee; Solid Waste MOU; Court Administration re: trials; a department
head evaluation; County Management; parking for fleet vehicles on campus; shared maintenance
issues; virtual meeting with locals; County Attorney consult; and water issues in the tunnel. He
noted that spring road restrictions were removed yesterday for areas south of Hwy 10, and on
Friday for areas north of Hwy 10.

The meeting adjourned at 10:05 a.m. |
R s

‘Frank Gross, Chéir/w
County Board of Commissioners

Stephen Larson, County Administrator

w
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ENGINEERED SOLUTIONS

11155 Chaparrai Avenue
Shakopee, MN 55379
Ph. 952-496-1049

Sales Engineers:
Aaron Young
Cell: 651-271-6141
Email: ayoung@ContechES.com

=il =

Customer Service Contact

Gwen Phinney

Ph. 972-590-2013

E-Mail: gphinney@conteches.com
Shakopee Plant Contact:

Lynette Eckblad and Spencer Keppel
Ph. 952-496-1049

Fax: 952-496-1152

E-mail: shakopee@conteches.com

Clay County Highway Department April 21, 2020
ROUND ARCH
PIPE GALV GALV PIPE GALV

DIA GAUGE 22/3"x1/2" ALT2 APRON SIZE GALV ALT2 APRON
6* 18 $7.00 Call for pricing N/A N/A N/A N/A

8* 16 $9.00 |call for pricing $75.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A
10* 16 $11.00 |call for pricing $80.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

12 16 $11.50 $12.78 $50.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

15 16 $13.00 $14.44 $60.00 17 x 13 $14.44 $16.99 $58.00
18 16 $17.25 $19.17 $80.00 21x15 $19.17 $22.55 $71.00
21 16 $19.55 $21.72 $110.00 24x 18 $21.72 $25.56 $95.00
24 16 $21.85 $24.28 $115.00 28 x 20 $24.28 $28.56 $100.00
30 14 $33.35 $37.06 $235.00 35x 24 $37.06 $43.59 $225.00
36 14 $41.40 $46.00 $375.00 42 x 29 $46.00 $54.12 $350.00
42 12 $65.55 $72.83 $650.00 49 x 33 $72.83 $85.69 $650.00
48 12 $75.75 $84.17 $750.00 57 x 38 $84.17 $99.02 $725.00
54 12 $83.95 $93.28 $850.00 64 x 43 $93.28 $109.74 | $950.00
60 10 $128.75 $143.06 | $1,250.00 | 71x47 $143.06 | $168.30 | $1,350.00
66 10 $141.25 $156.94 | $1,350.00 | 77x52 | $156.94 | $184.64 | $1,400.00
72 10 $156.25 $173.61 $1,650.00 83 x 57 $173.61 $204.25 | $1,650.00

NOTES: Prices do not include sales tax.

CONTECH Standard Terms and Conditions apply, 1/2 10 NET 30.

Delivery to Clay County, MN

We will strive to deliver in 2 days after receipt of order but not gauranteed.
12" wide 2 x If, 24" wide 3 x If

Freight:

Bands:

Gauges listed are DOT standard.

Call for pricing on all other items.



Effective Date:

Fargo
2/1/2020

1522 40th Street NW
Fargo, ND 58102

Phone: 701-282-0910
Fax: 701-281-1993

?ﬁ TrueNorthSteel

GALVANIZED CORRUGATED METAL PIPE
2 2/3"X1/2" CORRUGATIONS
ROUND ARCHED
End Bands Equv.| Spanx End Bands
Ga. | Dia. Helical Annular Section 12" Wide | 24" Wide Dia. Rise Helical | Annular | Section | 12" Wide | 24" Wide
o 12" $9.00 $10.80 $54.30 $10.80 $27.00
= |58 $10.80  $12.96 = $68.60 $12.96 $32.40 15" 17"X13" | $12.48 | $15.00 $58.60 $15.00 $37.56
© z f R I (e i I IS E—
o 18" $13.50  $16.20 $90.00 $16.20 $40.50 18" 21"X15" | $15.60 | $18.76 $70.00 $18.75 $46.95
- i !
24" $17.10 $20.52  $135.80 $20.52 $51.30 24" 28"X20" | $19.76 | $23.75 $98.60 $23.75 $59.47
End Bands Equv.| Spanx End Bands
Ga. | Dia. Helical Annular Section | 12"Wide | 24" Wide Dia. Rise Helical | Annular | Section | 12" Wide | 24" Wide
o 30" $27.00 $32.40  $268.60 $25.92 $64.80 30" 35"X24" | $31.20 | $37.50 | $165.80 | $30.00 $75.12
o) : ! o i I I el ! =
=3 | 36" $32.40 $38.88 $365.80 $31.32 $78.30 36" 42"X29" | $37.44 | $45.00 | $261.50 | $36.25 $90.77
© : NS SR Ce R R S -
2 42" $37.80 $45.36  $734.30 $36.72 $91.80 42" 49"X33" | $43.68 | $52.50 | $450.00 | $42.50 | $106.42
. : e e o, e PR IS BN S—— N Fa—
48" $43.20  $51.84 $855.80 $41.04 $102.60
End Bands Equv.| Spanx End Bands
Ga. | Dia. | Helical Annular | Section | 12" Wide | 24" Wide Dia. Rise Helical | Annular | Section | 12" Wide | 24" Wide
42" $51.30 $61.56 $734.30 $36.72 $91.80 42" 49"X33" | $59.28 | $71.25 | $450.00 | $42.50 | $106.42
o i : :
o)} ! i i
= | 48"  $5850 = $70.20  $855.80 $41.04 $102.60 48" 57"X38" | $67.60 | $81.25 | $561.50 | $47.50 | $118.94
© : i : - : : :
2 54" $6570 = $78.84 $991.50 $118.80 54" 64"X43" | $75.92 | $91.25 | $780.00 $137.72
60" $72.90 $87.48  $1,454.30 | $132.30
|
End Bands Equv.| Spanx End Bands
Ga. | Dia. Helical Annular Section 12" Wide | 24" Wide Dia. Rise Helical | Annular | Section | 12" Wide | 24" Wide
g, 60" $9270  $111.24 | $1,454.30 $132.30 60" i 71"X47" | $107.12 | $128.75 | $1,145.80 $153.37
: - - = - :. , - o -
@ | g6” $101.70  $122.04 | $1,598.60 $143.10
o
2 72" $110.70 $132.84 | $1,734.30 $159.30

Al Helical and Annular CSP Prices are per Lineal Foot and include delivery.
More sizes and options available, contact your sales representative for more information.
All prices are subject to change without notice.
Bold Items note Recommended Diameter/Gauge Combinations.
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Fargo
1522:40th Street NW
Fargo, ND 58102

Phone: 701-282-0910
Fax: 701-281-1993

a TrueNorth Ste

orth D o

T10 ' :
GALVANIZED CORRUGATED METAL PIPE
5"X1" CORRUGATIONS
ROUND ARCHED
End Bands quv. | Spanx End Bands
Ga. | Dia. Helical Annular Section 12" Wide | 24" Wide Dia. Rise Helical | Annular | Section | 12" Wide | 24" Wide
© | 48" $36.10 - $855.80 | | $102.60
g’ 54" | 94180 | — | $99180 } 1 $118.80 i )
g 60" | §4655 | — $1,454.30 e $132.30 : )
o | 6| 85035 | -~ |sts8e0)| | $143.10 | ) i §
— | 72| $56.05 ~ | $1,734.30 $159.30 |
End Bands Span x End Bands
Ga. | Dia. Helical Annular Section 12" Wide | 24" Wide Rise Helical | Annular | Section | 12" Wide | 24" Wide
48" $45.60 oo $855.80 $102.60
O lsa ssra0 | — | sess0 | $118.80
8 60"  $56.05 &  — $1,454.30 | $13230
e se270 — | $1,508.60 | $143.10
e L NP L R S A NI IR N
72"  $68.40 - $1,734.30 $159.30
End Bands Span x End | Bands
Ga. | Dia. Helical Annular Section 12" Wide 24" Wide Rise Helical | Annular | Section | 12" Wide | 24" Wide
o 72" $92.15 - $1,734.30 $159.30 81"X59" | $106.70 - $2,051.50 $184.67
g’ 78"  $99.75 i - $1,921.50 $207.90 87'X63" | $115.50 — $2,791.50 $241.01
8 84" $107.35 - $2,275.80 $224.10 95"X67" | $124.30 — $2,881.50 $259.79
90"  $114.95 | - $4,042.90 $237.60 90" | 103"X71" | $133.10 — $3,227.20 i $275.44
N ! e !
96"  $123.50 - $4,167.20 $256.50 112"X75" | $143.00 - $3,731.50 i $297.35
End Bands - quv. [ Spanx End Bands
Ga. | Dia. | Helical Annular Section | 12"Wide | 24" Wide i Rise Helical | Annular | Section | 12" Wide | 24" Wide
96" $157.70 - $4,167.20 5256.50 112"X75" | $182.60 — $3,731.50 $297.35
m | B— - - Ea—— PO - - — s ammnne - —— -~ FO——
o) | 102" $166.25 - - ; $272.70 102" | 117'X79" | $192.50 - - $316.13
: ; t : - = g e e ——
8 108" $176.70 } - - { $286.20 108" i 128"X83" | $204.60 - - $331.78
O |114" 18820 | — § $41580 M 114" | 137°X87" | §21560 | — - $482.02
- } . P . - ! . ! SR (A
120" $195.70 | - - % $437.40 120" | 142"X91" | $226.60 - — $507.06

All Helical and Annular CSP Prices are per Lineal Foot and include delivery.
More sizes and options available, contact your sales representative for more information.
All prices are subject to change without notice.
Bold Items note Recommended Diameter/Gauge Combinations.
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CLAY COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

FURNISHING BITUMINOUS MIXTURE
LETTING: April 30th, 2020 @ 10:00 a.m.

: : “, ‘ , BID PRICE PER TON Al
“CONTRACTOR | MATERIAL ‘ I o wuocousey 0 o] PLANT LOCATION
PR : | | FURNISH & LOAD AT PLANTSITE s

Border States Paving, Inc. PG 58-28 Hot Bituminous Mixture (3/4" minus) $58.00 4101 32nd St N Fargo, ND
PG 58-28 Hot Bituminous Mixture (1/2" minus) $85.00 4101 32nd St N Fargo, ND
SC 800 Cold Bituminous Mixture No Bid
Cold Mix Sylvax UPM/Optimix-or approved equal No Bid

Central Specialties, Inc. PG 58-28 Hot Bituminous Mixture (3/4" minus) $64.30 Stephanson
PG 58-28 Hot Bituminous Mixture (1/2" minus) $66.05 . Stephanson
SC 800 Cold Bituminous Mixture No Bid
Cold Mix Sylvax UPM/Optimix-or approved equal No Bid

Northern Improvement Co.  |PG 58-28 Hot Bituminous Mixture (3/4" minus) $56.00 7610 50th Ave. S. Sabin, MN
PG 58-28 Hot Bituminous Mixture (1/2" minus) $62.00 7610 50th Ave. S. Sabin, MN
SC 800 Cold Bituminous Mixture No Bid
Cold Mix Sylvax UPM/Optimix-or approved equal $175.00 4716 7th Ave. NW Fargo, ND

FM Asphalt, LLC PG 58-28 Hot Bituminous Mixture (3/4" minus) $54.00 Highay 10 East Dilworth, MN
PG 58-28 Hot Bituminous Mixture (1/2" minus) No Bid
SC 800 Cold Bituminous Mixture No Bid
Cold Mix Sylvax UPM/Optimix-or approved equal No Bid

ENGINEER'S RECOMMENDATION: Accept all bids

lellwﬂi\ 5-5-20

David L. Overbo, Clay County Engineer Date




2020 Equipment Rental

Fitzgerald |D-5cat (95 hp) i $145
Construction knc. D-51 Komatsu (110 h.p.) pvm
D:61 Komatsu (140 h.p.) 165
D-65 Komatsu (170 h.p.) 180
D-6 Cat (170 h. $180)
Cat 420 (90 h.p.) 135
Cat 319 150
Cat 320 150
Cat329 185
Sterling 6-Axle (14 n<_ 100
i |Peterbilt 5-Axle (13 9.
Kenworth 6-Axle (14 CY) $100|
50K 5-AIE (13 CY) ;
Turner 2008 PC300 Komatsu (232 h.p. 2.75CY 39'rch) $155
sand & Gravellnc. 2002 PC600 Komatsu (384 h.p. 5CY 33'rch) 230
2015 PC 490 Komatsu (359 h.p. 4CY 43' 10" rch) 205
2004 Mack CV713 4axle (12 CY) 100
2004 Mack CV713 w/pup 7axle (20 CY) 105
2006 Mack CXN613 belly 6axle (19 €Y) 105
2007 CV713 w/strong arm (17 CY) 105
2015 Kenworth 880 belly 6axle (18 CY) 105
2006 Mack CXN613 W/ Lowboy 8 Axle 150
2006 Mack CXI Lowboy 10 Axl 70
2005 Komatsu D1 New W/ fodde wum
Sellin 1988 Terex TS-14B (14 CY 288 HP) $185
Brothers, Inc, 1980 Terex TS-14B (14.CY 288 HP) $185,
1980 Terex TS-148 (14 CY, 288 HP) 185
1983 Terex TS-148B (14 CY 288 HP) 185
1978 Terex TS-14B (14 CY 288 HP). 5185
2014 D39PX-23 Komatsu (89 h.p.)
2-2017 D51PX-24 Komatsu (130 h.p.)
2018 D51PX-24 Komatsu (130 h.p.)
2019 D51PX-24 Komatsu (130 h.p.
2012 D-65PX-17 Komatsu (190 h.p.)
2016 D61PX-24 Komatsu (168 h.p.)
2018 D61PX-24 Komatsu (168 h.p.)
2012 D61PX-15 Kamatsu ( 168 h.p.)
1978 D9H Cat Push Cat (410 h.p.)
1964 DIG Cat Push Cat (385 h.p.) B
2016 420F2 CAT (96 h.p.)
[2-2013'420F CAT (130 h.p.)
i 2019 420F2 CAT (130 h.p.)

_ 2014 PC490LC-10 Komatsu (359 h.p. 43'-10"rch_

2014 vﬁwmo_h 10 xo:_u_.ﬁ: Nmu h.p. am..u.e..:.é

Nouu <<>wwo.q xn:.uﬁ: 191 h.| .p, 4.25 cY)

20; matsu (191 h.p. 4.25CY)

Nopm <<>umo 8 xo:ﬁ.m: ﬁmu h, u. 4 n:

2-2011 103200 (89h.p. 78"

2017 n>... 259D Track (82h.p. 80")
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2020 EQUIPMENT RENTAL

ey Contracting/Inc. | John Deere 850J (205 h.p.) $140
John Deere 750 (160 h.p.) $130)
Case 750K (90 h.p.) 110,
1D 450X (360 hp) . 225
Case CS350B (248 hp) 200
Case CX2908 (207 hp) 150
Case CX210B (160 hp) 130)
Case CX160B (120 hp) 120
John Deere 80C (50 hp) . 100|
Case CXS0B (40 hp) 100
Case 350 (300hp) 225
Komatsu PCS0UU (40hp) 100
Various Tandem Models $88|
 Tractor and Lowboy 300
Tractor and flatbed 130
Tractor and Side Dump 130
Case 821 with forks and bucket 128
Case 621 E with Forks and Bucket 15
Bobcat-Tracked 98
Bobcat-Wheeled 98
New Holland L190 $98|
D51 Komatsu Dozer g i i ¥ v : goeta I Rt e o] D " 3 [ i $150|
D39 Komatsu Dozer
oy v o i i o S iy b b

210 Class Excavator

Mini Excavator W/ Plate Compactor
Wi e G

e

3 ; 8- SIDE Dump Trucks $120]
VAR | Quad Dump Trucks »d.w._
Engineer's Recommendation: Accept all bids
WVJV L ok $-5-20
David L. Overbo, Clay County Engineer Date
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2020 GRAVELING
TURNER SAND & GRAVEL, INC. STRATA FITZGERALD CONST. INC Aggregate Industries
Twp. Estimated Furnish, Crush, Furnish, Crush, Pit Name Furnish, Crush, Furnish, Crush, 1 Pit Name Furnish, Crush, w:—zw?ﬁam? Pit Name Furnish, Crush, Furnish, Crush, Pit Name
Number Quantity Load & Haul & Load and Load & Haul & Load and ‘Load & Haul & Load and Load & Haul Load & Haul and
(Tons) Per Ton Per Ton Location Per Ton Per Ton Location Per Ton Per Ton Location Per Ton Per Ton Location
(5ee Note) (See Note) (See Note) (See Note) (See Note) (See Note) (See Note) (See Note)
Contractor Haul County Haul a Contractor Haul |  County Haul Contractor Haul County Haul Contractor Haul | Contractor Haul |
1 7,500 $7.85 $4.15 Co. Felton - Sec. 6 Keene Twp. $9.00 $5.00 142 Hauerkamp
2 2,400 $6.79 $4.15 Co. Felton - Sec. 6 Keene Twp. $9,00 $5.00 142 Hauerkamp
3 3,000 $6.21 Green Pit- Sec. 21 Hagen Twp. $8.50 $5.00 142 Hauerkamp $6.50 Villiard Pit- Sec. 13 Keene Twp.
4 5,000 $6.21 Green Pit- Sec. 21 Hagen Twp. $8.50 $5.00 142 Hauerkamp $6.50 jard Pit- Sec. 13 Keene Twp.
5 2,500 $5.89 ! falen Pit- Sec. 24 Hagen Twp $8.50 $5.00 142 Hauerkamp $6.50 ard Pit- Sec, 13 Keene Twp.
6 10,200 $8.04 $4.15 Co. Felton - Sec. 6 Keene Twp. $9.00 $5.00 142 Hauerkamp
7 4,500 $6.79 $4.15 Co. Felton - Sec. 6 Keene Twp. $8.50 $5.00 142 Hauerkamp .
8 5,700 $6.20 $4.15 Co. Felton - Sec. 6 Keene Twp. $8.00 $5.00 142 Hauerkamp $6.50 Villiard Pit- Sec. 13 Keene Twp.
9 4,600 $5.89 Lomsdalen Pit- Sec. 24 Hagen Twp $8.00 $5.00 142 Hauerkamp $6.50 $10.75 Villiard Pit- Sec, 13 Keene Twp.
10 1,200 $5.89 Lomsdalen Pit- Sec. 24 Hagen Twp $9.50 $5.00 142 Hauerkamp $6.50 $10.75 Villiard Pit- Sec, 13 Keene Twp.
11 1,900 $8.80 $4.15 Co. Felton - Sec. 6 Keene Twp. $9.50 $5.00 142 Hauerkamp
12 6,650 $7.47 $4.15 Co. Felton - Sec. 6 Keene Twp. $8.50 $5.00 142 Hauerkamp
13 4,000 $6.79 $4.15 Co. Felton - Sec. 6 Keene Twp. $8.50 $5.00 Rollag Pit - Sec. 31 Corm. Twp $6.50 Villiard Pit- Sec, 13 Keene Twp.
14 2,000 $8.28 $4.30 Braseth Pit - Sec. 13 Parke Twp. $8.50 $5.00 Rollag Pit - Sec, 31 Corm. Twp $6.50 Villiard Pit- Sec. 13 Keene Twp.
15 3,500 $7.52 $4.30 Braseth Pit - Sec, 13 Parke Twp. $8.50 $5.00 Rollag Pit - Sec. 31 Corm. Twp $6.50 Villiard Pit- Sec, 13 Keene Twp.
16 3,500 $9.05 $4.25 Hough Pit - Sec. 36 Humboldt Twp. $9.50 $5.00 Rollag Pit - Sec. 31 Corm, Twp
17 2,450 $8.61 $4.15 Co. Felton - Sec. 6 Keene Twp. $9.00 $5.00 Rollag Pit - Sec, 31 Corm. Twp
18 0 $7.85 $4.15 Co. Felton - Sec., 6 Keene Twp, $9.00 $5,00 Rollag Pit - Sec. 31 Corm. Twp
19 6,400 $7.24 $4.30 Braseth Pit - Sec. 13 Parke Twp. $8.50 $5.00 Rollag Pit - Sec. 31 Corm. Twp
20 2,900 $6.45 $4.30 Braseth Pit - Sec, 13 Parke Twp. $8.50 $5.00 Rollag Pit - Sec, 31 Corm. Twp $11.55 $5.25 Young Pit
21 3,150 $9.03 $4.25 Hough Pit - Sec. 36 Humboldt Twp. $9.50 $5.00 Rollag Pit - Sec. 31 Corm. Twp $14.00 $5.25 Young Pit
22 3,800 $7.96 $4.25 Hough Pit - Sec. 36 Humboldt Twp. $8.50 $5.00 Rollag Pit - Sec. 31 Corm. Twp $13.75 $5.25 Young Pit
23 0 $7.33 $4.30 Braseth Pit - Sec. 13 Parke Twp. $8.50 $5.00 Rollag Pit - Sec. 31 Corm. Twp
24 2,400 $6.20 $4.30 Braseth Pit - Sec. 13 Parke Twp. $8.50 $5.00 Rollag Pit - Sec. 31 Corm. Twp $9.75 $5.25 Young Pit
25 1,700 $6.20 $4.30 Braseth Pit - Sec. 13 Parke Twp. $8.00 $5.00 Rollag Pit - Sec. 31 Corm. Twp $8.75 $5.25 Young Pit
26 5,200 $8.86 $4.25 Hough Pit - Sec. 36 Humboldt Twp. $10.00 $5.00 Rollag Pit - Sec. 31 Corm. Twp
27 6,600 $7.91 $4.25 Hough Pit - Sec. 36 Humboldt Twp. $9.50 $5.00 Rollag Pit - Sec. 31 Corm. Twp
28 3,800 $6.71 $4,25 Hough Pit - Sec. 36 Humboldt Twp. $9.00 $5.00 Rollag Pit - Sec. 31 Corm. Twp
29 1,600 $6.11 $4.25 Hough Pit - Sec. 36 Humboldt Twp. $8.50 $5.00 Rollag Pit - Sec. 31 Corm. Twp
30 1,200 $5.89 $4.25 Hough Pit - Sec. 36 Humboldt Twp. $8.00 $5.00 Rollag Pit - Sec. 31 Corm. Twp
Total 109,350

Note: Prices reflect an additional $0.42 per ton for material originating from the Co. Felton Pit - Sec. 6 Keene Twp.

Engineer's Recommendation:
Accept Low bids of Turner Sand & Gravel Inc. For Twp #'s- 1-12, 16-30; Aggregate Industries for Twp. #'s 13-15
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